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WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO : 02Y022 REVISION NO : 1 BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
CONTRACT NO : 006568 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Apr 28 2003
VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : XL1298
HWY : SR 012 ------- LOW BIDDER ------- ------- 2ND BIDDER ------- ------- 3RD BIDDER -------

TITLE : US 12 
DIXIE VIC. - BR. REPLACEMENT

02Y022

WEAVER CONSTRUCTION CO. HARCON INCORPORATED SHEA GRAHAM CONSTRUCTION
2208 MAY LN 3931 E BOONE AVE 331 N FANCHER RD-99211-0831
PO BOX 428 PO BOX 11954

PROJECT : LAGRANDE   OR  978500428 SPOKANE   WA  992024536 SPOKANE   WA  992111954

COUNTY(S) : WALLA WALLA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 869910 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100270 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100205

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

03/27/2003
07:59

DOT_RGGB01

BR-0012(121)

PREPARATION
1 MOBILIZATION

L.S. 58.87 % 61.29 % -23.17 %
62,000.00 98,500.00 36,500.00 100,000.00 38,000.00 47,635.00 -14,365.00

3,000.0000
2 CLEARING AND GRUBBING

2.5000 ACRE 2,000.0000 50.00 % 8,000.0000 300.00 % 508.4000 -74.58 %
5,000.00 7,500.00 2,500.00 20,000.00 15,000.00 1,271.00 -3,729.00

3 REMOVING EXISTING BRIDGE NO. 12/657
L.S. -22.58 % -19.35 % -30.29 %

31,000.00 24,000.00 -7,000.00 25,000.00 -6,000.00 21,610.00 -9,390.00

GRADING

4.0000
4  ROADWAY REMOVAL

7780.0000 S.Y. 6.0000 -33.33 % 1.0000 -83.33 % 1.2700 -78.83 %
46,680.00 31,120.00 -15,560.00 7,780.00 -38,900.00 9,880.60 -36,799.40

10.0000
5 ROADWAY EXCAVATION INCL. HAUL

470.0000 C.Y. 8.0000 25.00 % 12.0000 50.00 % 10.1700 27.12 %
3,760.00 4,700.00 940.00 5,640.00 1,880.00 4,779.90 1,019.90

10.0000
6 COMMON BORROW INCL. HAUL

6760.0000 C.Y. 12.0000 -16.67 % 4.0000 -66.67 % 10.1700 -15.25 %
81,120.00 67,600.00 -13,520.00 27,040.00 -54,080.00 68,749.20 -12,370.80

3.0000
7 EMBANKMENT COMPACTION

10580.0000 C.Y. 0.5000 500.00 % 3.0000 500.00 % 3.8100 662.00 %
5,290.00 31,740.00 26,450.00 31,740.00 26,450.00 40,309.80 35,019.80

8  DETOUR REMOVAL
L.S. 29.03 % -74.19 % -1.59 %

15,500.00 20,000.00 4,500.00 4,000.00 -11,500.00 15,254.00 -246.00

DRAINAGE

27.0000
9 LIGHT LOOSE RIPRAP

590.0000 TON 50.0000 -46.00 % 25.0000 -50.00 % 38.1400 -23.72 %
29,500.00 15,930.00 -13,570.00 14,750.00 -14,750.00 22,502.60 -6,997.40

21.0000
10 PLAIN ST. CULV. PIPE 0.079 IN. TH. 18 IN. DIAM.

120.0000 L.F. 35.0000 -40.00 % 25.0000 -28.57 % 35.5800 1.66 %
4,200.00 2,520.00 -1,680.00 3,000.00 -1,200.00 4,269.60 69.60
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WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO : 02Y022 REVISION NO : 1 BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
CONTRACT NO : 006568 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Apr 28 2003
VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : XL1298
HWY : SR 012 ------- LOW BIDDER ------- ------- 2ND BIDDER ------- ------- 3RD BIDDER -------

TITLE : US 12 
DIXIE VIC. - BR. REPLACEMENT

02Y022

WEAVER CONSTRUCTION CO. HARCON INCORPORATED SHEA GRAHAM CONSTRUCTION
2208 MAY LN 3931 E BOONE AVE 331 N FANCHER RD-99211-0831
PO BOX 428 PO BOX 11954

PROJECT : LAGRANDE   OR  978500428 SPOKANE   WA  992024536 SPOKANE   WA  992111954

COUNTY(S) : WALLA WALLA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 869910 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100270 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100205

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

03/27/2003
07:59

DOT_RGGB01

BR-0012(121)

DRAINAGE

65.0000
11 PLAIN ST. CULV. PIPE 0.079 IN. TH. 48 IN. DIAM.

80.0000 L.F. 65.0000 0.00 % 80.0000 23.08 % 66.1000 1.69 %
5,200.00 5,200.00 0.00 6,400.00 1,200.00 5,288.00 88.00

70.0000
12  HABITAT ROCK

6.0000 EACH 50.0000 40.00 % 400.0000 700.00 % 317.6700 535.34 %
300.00 420.00 120.00 2,400.00 2,100.00 1,906.02 1,606.02

26.0000
13  STREAMBED GRAVEL

120.0000 C.Y. 30.0000 -13.33 % 20.0000 -33.33 % 30.5100 1.70 %
3,600.00 3,120.00 -480.00 2,400.00 -1,200.00 3,661.20 61.20

STRUCTURE

15.0000
14 STRUCTURE EXCAVATION CLASS A INCL. HAUL

675.0000 C.Y. 15.0000 0.00 % 12.0000 -20.00 % 10.1700 -32.20 %
10,125.00 10,125.00 0.00 8,100.00 -2,025.00 6,864.75 -3,260.25

15 SHORING OR EXTRA EXCAVATION CL. A - BR. NO. 12/657
L.S. -76.56 % -68.75 % -96.03 %

32,000.00 7,500.00 -24,500.00 10,000.00 -22,000.00 1,271.00 -30,729.00

35.0000
16 GRAVEL BACKFILL FOR WALL

190.0000 C.Y. 25.0000 40.00 % 25.0000 0.00 % 48.3100 93.24 %
4,750.00 6,650.00 1,900.00 4,750.00 0.00 9,178.90 4,428.90

0.5500
17 ST. REINF. BAR FOR BRIDGE

37680.0000 LB. 0.5000 10.00 % 0.5000 0.00 % 0.6600 32.00 %
18,840.00 20,724.00 1,884.00 18,840.00 0.00 24,868.80 6,028.80

350.0000
18 CONC. CLASS 4000 FOR BRIDGE

213.0000 C.Y. 400.0000 -12.50 % 350.0000 -12.50 % 322.9700 -19.26 %
85,200.00 74,550.00 -10,650.00 74,550.00 -10,650.00 68,792.61 -16,407.39

19 DEFICIENT STRENGTH CONC. PRICE ADJUSTMENT
CALC 0.00 % 0.00 % 0.00 %

1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00
20 SUPERSTRUCTURE - BR. NO. 12/657

L.S. 12.78 % 39.10 % 8.28 %
133,000.00 150,000.00 17,000.00 185,000.00 52,000.00 144,012.00 11,012.00

12.0000
21 ELECTRICAL CONDUIT

580.0000 L.F. 10.0000 20.00 % 12.0000 20.00 % 14.8700 48.70 %
5,800.00 6,960.00 1,160.00 6,960.00 1,160.00 8,624.60 2,824.60
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WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO : 02Y022 REVISION NO : 1 BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
CONTRACT NO : 006568 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Apr 28 2003
VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : XL1298
HWY : SR 012 ------- LOW BIDDER ------- ------- 2ND BIDDER ------- ------- 3RD BIDDER -------

TITLE : US 12 
DIXIE VIC. - BR. REPLACEMENT

02Y022

WEAVER CONSTRUCTION CO. HARCON INCORPORATED SHEA GRAHAM CONSTRUCTION
2208 MAY LN 3931 E BOONE AVE 331 N FANCHER RD-99211-0831
PO BOX 428 PO BOX 11954

PROJECT : LAGRANDE   OR  978500428 SPOKANE   WA  992024536 SPOKANE   WA  992111954

COUNTY(S) : WALLA WALLA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 869910 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100270 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100205

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

03/27/2003
07:59

DOT_RGGB01

BR-0012(121)

STRUCTURE

57.0000
22 BRIDGE RAILING TYPE BP

268.0000 L.F. 50.0000 14.00 % 50.0000 0.00 % 69.9100 39.82 %
13,400.00 15,276.00 1,876.00 13,400.00 0.00 18,735.88 5,335.88

65.0000
23 TRAFFIC BARRIER

268.0000 L.F. 70.0000 -7.14 % 75.0000 7.14 % 115.2200 64.60 %
18,760.00 17,420.00 -1,340.00 20,100.00 1,340.00 30,878.96 12,118.96

SURFACING

12.0000
24 CRUSHED SURFACING BASE COURSE

7300.0000 TON 10.0000 20.00 % 10.0000 0.00 % 15.7400 57.40 %
73,000.00 87,600.00 14,600.00 73,000.00 0.00 114,902.00 41,902.00

LIQUID ASPHALT
25 ANTI-STRIPPING ADDITIVE

EST. 0.00 % 0.00 % 0.00 %
2,390.00 2,390.00 2,390.00 2,390.00

CEMENT CONCRETE PAVEMENT

150.0000
26 BRIDGE APPROACH SLAB

232.0000 S.Y. 160.0000 -6.25 % 125.0000 -21.88 % 147.2700 -7.96 %
37,120.00 34,800.00 -2,320.00 29,000.00 -8,120.00 34,166.64 -2,953.36

ASPHALT CONCRETE PAVEMENT

44.5000
27 ASPHALT CONC. PAVEMENT CL. A  PG 64-28

2390.0000 TON 35.0000 27.14 % 46.0000 31.43 % 48.2000 37.71 %
83,650.00 106,355.00 22,705.00 109,940.00 26,290.00 115,198.00 31,548.00

28 COMPACTION PRICE ADJUSTMENT
CALC 0.00 % 0.00 % 0.00 %

1,434.00 1,434.00 1,434.00 1,434.00
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WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO : 02Y022 REVISION NO : 1 BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
CONTRACT NO : 006568 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Apr 28 2003
VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : XL1298
HWY : SR 012 ------- LOW BIDDER ------- ------- 2ND BIDDER ------- ------- 3RD BIDDER -------

TITLE : US 12 
DIXIE VIC. - BR. REPLACEMENT

02Y022

WEAVER CONSTRUCTION CO. HARCON INCORPORATED SHEA GRAHAM CONSTRUCTION
2208 MAY LN 3931 E BOONE AVE 331 N FANCHER RD-99211-0831
PO BOX 428 PO BOX 11954

PROJECT : LAGRANDE   OR  978500428 SPOKANE   WA  992024536 SPOKANE   WA  992111954

COUNTY(S) : WALLA WALLA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 869910 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100270 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100205

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

03/27/2003
07:59

DOT_RGGB01

BR-0012(121)

EROSION CONTROL AND PLANTING

375.0000
29 ESC LEAD

30.0000 DAY 50.0000 650.00 % 50.0000 0.00 % 152.5300 205.06 %
1,500.00 11,250.00 9,750.00 1,500.00 0.00 4,575.90 3,075.90

1,100.0000
30 SEEDING AND MULCHING

2.5000 ACRE 1,000.0000 10.00 % 1,500.0000 50.00 % 1,392.0000 39.20 %
2,500.00 2,750.00 250.00 3,750.00 1,250.00 3,480.00 980.00

125.0000
31 CHECK DAM

60.0000 L.F. 40.0000 212.50 % 30.0000 -25.00 % 31.7700 -20.58 %
2,400.00 7,500.00 5,100.00 1,800.00 -600.00 1,906.20 -493.80

3.0000
32 SILT FENCE

420.0000 L.F. 3.0000 0.00 % 4.0000 33.33 % 1.7800 -40.67 %
1,260.00 1,260.00 0.00 1,680.00 420.00 747.60 -512.40

7.0000
33 TOPSOIL TYPE B

100.0000 C.Y. 12.0000 -41.67 % 6.0000 -50.00 % 10.1600 -15.33 %
1,200.00 700.00 -500.00 600.00 -600.00 1,016.00 -184.00

34 EROSION/WATER POLLUTION CONTROL
EST. 0.00 % 0.00 % 0.00 %

2,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00

TRAFFIC

18.0000
35 BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 1

200.0000 L.F. 12.0000 50.00 % 18.0000 50.00 % 20.3400 69.50 %
2,400.00 3,600.00 1,200.00 3,600.00 1,200.00 4,068.00 1,668.00

910.0000
36 BEAM GUARDRAIL TRANSITION SECTION TYPE 1

4.0000 EACH 1,000.0000 -9.00 % 900.0000 -10.00 % 762.5000 -23.75 %
4,000.00 3,640.00 -360.00 3,600.00 -400.00 3,050.00 -950.00

1,700.0000
37 BEAM GUARDRAIL FLARED TERMINAL

4.0000 EACH 1,500.0000 13.33 % 1,700.0000 13.33 % 2,288.0000 52.53 %
6,000.00 6,800.00 800.00 6,800.00 800.00 9,152.00 3,152.00

10.0000
38 TEMPORARY CONC. BARRIER

762.5000 L.F. 10.0000 0.00 % 10.0000 0.00 % 12.7100 27.10 %
7,625.00 7,625.00 0.00 7,625.00 0.00 9,691.38 2,066.38

2,700.0000
39 TEMPORARY IMPACT ATTENUATOR

7.0000 EACH 2,000.0000 35.00 % 5,000.0000 150.00 % 5,959.5700 197.98 %
14,000.00 18,900.00 4,900.00 35,000.00 21,000.00 41,716.99 27,716.99
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WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO : 02Y022 REVISION NO : 1 BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
CONTRACT NO : 006568 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Apr 28 2003
VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : XL1298
HWY : SR 012 ------- LOW BIDDER ------- ------- 2ND BIDDER ------- ------- 3RD BIDDER -------

TITLE : US 12 
DIXIE VIC. - BR. REPLACEMENT

02Y022

WEAVER CONSTRUCTION CO. HARCON INCORPORATED SHEA GRAHAM CONSTRUCTION
2208 MAY LN 3931 E BOONE AVE 331 N FANCHER RD-99211-0831
PO BOX 428 PO BOX 11954

PROJECT : LAGRANDE   OR  978500428 SPOKANE   WA  992024536 SPOKANE   WA  992111954

COUNTY(S) : WALLA WALLA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 869910 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100270 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100205

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

03/27/2003
07:59

DOT_RGGB01

BR-0012(121)

TRAFFIC
40 REPAIR IMPACT ATTENUATOR

EST. 0.00 % 0.00 % 0.00 %
1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00

0.2000
41 TEMPORARY PAVEMENT MARKING

9169.0000 L.F. 0.2500 -20.00 % 0.2000 -20.00 % 0.0600 -76.00 %
2,292.25 1,833.80 -458.45 1,833.80 -458.45 550.14 -1,742.11

42 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES
L.S. 75.00 % -37.50 % -80.95 %

2,000.00 3,500.00 1,500.00 1,250.00 -750.00 381.00 -1,619.00

35.0000
43 TRAFFIC CONTROL LABOR

560.0000 HR 32.0000 9.38 % 33.5000 4.69 % 40.6800 27.12 %
17,920.00 19,600.00 1,680.00 18,760.00 840.00 22,780.80 4,860.80

45.0000
44 TRAFFIC CONTROL VEHICLE

58.0000 DAY 50.0000 -10.00 % 35.0000 -30.00 % 31.7800 -36.44 %
2,900.00 2,610.00 -290.00 2,030.00 -870.00 1,843.24 -1,056.76

35.0000
45 TRAFFIC CONTROL SUPERVISOR

232.0000 HR 35.0000 0.00 % 35.0000 0.00 % 45.6500 30.43 %
8,120.00 8,120.00 0.00 8,120.00 0.00 10,590.80 2,470.80

22.0000
46 CONSTRUCTION SIGNS CLASS A

320.0000 S.F. 6.0000 266.67 % 7.0000 16.67 % 5.0800 -15.33 %
1,920.00 7,040.00 5,120.00 2,240.00 320.00 1,625.60 -294.40

OTHER ITEMS
47 STRUCTURE SURVEYING

L.S. -1.43 % -28.57 % -31.00 %
7,000.00 6,900.00 -100.00 5,000.00 -2,000.00 4,830.00 -2,170.00

2.0000
48 TRAINING

400.0000 HR 2.0000 0.00 % 2.0000 0.00 % 27.9700 1,298.50 %
800.00 800.00 0.00 800.00 0.00 11,188.00 10,388.00

49 ROADSIDE CLEANUP
EST. 0.00 % 0.00 % 0.00 %

2,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00
50 REIMBURSEMENT FOR THIRD PARTY DAMAGE

EST. 0.00 % 0.00 % 0.00 %
5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00
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WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO : 02Y022 REVISION NO : 1 BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
CONTRACT NO : 006568 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Apr 28 2003
VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : XL1298
HWY : SR 012 ------- LOW BIDDER ------- ------- 2ND BIDDER ------- ------- 3RD BIDDER -------

TITLE : US 12 
DIXIE VIC. - BR. REPLACEMENT

02Y022

WEAVER CONSTRUCTION CO. HARCON INCORPORATED SHEA GRAHAM CONSTRUCTION
2208 MAY LN 3931 E BOONE AVE 331 N FANCHER RD-99211-0831
PO BOX 428 PO BOX 11954

PROJECT : LAGRANDE   OR  978500428 SPOKANE   WA  992024536 SPOKANE   WA  992111954

COUNTY(S) : WALLA WALLA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 869910 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100270 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100205

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

03/27/2003
07:59

DOT_RGGB01

BR-0012(121)

OTHER ITEMS
51 MINOR CHANGE

CALC 0.00 % 0.00 % 0.00 %
-1.00 -1.00 -1.00 -1.00

52 SPCC PLAN
L.S. -60.00 % -50.00 % 1.60 %

1,000.00 400.00 -600.00 500.00 -500.00 1,016.00 16.00
53 FIELD OFFICE BUILDING

L.S. -17.33 % -66.67 % -77.91 %
7,500.00 6,200.00 -1,300.00 2,500.00 -5,000.00 1,657.00 -5,843.00

3.5000
54 CONSTRUCTION GEOTEXTILE FOR PERMANENT EROSION CONTROL

310.0000 S.Y. 2.0000 75.00 % 2.0000 0.00 % 3.5000 75.00 %
620.00 1,085.00 465.00 620.00 0.00 1,085.00 465.00

BASE TOTAL $911,582.25 $980,253.80 7.53 % $921,228.80 1.06 % $969,392.71 6.34 %
ALTERNATE A1

55  TEMPORARY BRIDGE NO. 12/657
L.S. -100.00 % -8.85 % 2.97 %

192,000.00 0.00 -192,000.00 175,000.00 -17,000.00 197,700.00 5,700.00

ALTERNATE A1 TOTAL $192,000.00 NO BID THIS ALTERNATE $175,000.00 -8.85 % $197,700.00 2.97 %
ALTERNATE A2

56  TEMPORARY BRIDGE NO. 12/657
L.S. -66.67 % -100.00 % -100.00 %

192,000.00 64,000.00 -128,000.00 0.00 -192,000.00 0.00 -192,000.00

ALTERNATE A2 TOTAL $192,000.00 $64,000.00 -66.67 % NO BID THIS ALTERNATE NO BID THIS ALTERNATE

BASE TOTAL $911,582.25 $980,253.80 7.53% $921,228.80 1.06% $969,392.71 6.34%
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WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO : 02Y022 REVISION NO : 1 BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
CONTRACT NO : 006568 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Apr 28 2003
VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : XL1298
HWY : SR 012 ------- LOW BIDDER ------- ------- 2ND BIDDER ------- ------- 3RD BIDDER -------

TITLE : US 12 
DIXIE VIC. - BR. REPLACEMENT

02Y022

WEAVER CONSTRUCTION CO. HARCON INCORPORATED SHEA GRAHAM CONSTRUCTION
2208 MAY LN 3931 E BOONE AVE 331 N FANCHER RD-99211-0831
PO BOX 428 PO BOX 11954

PROJECT : LAGRANDE   OR  978500428 SPOKANE   WA  992024536 SPOKANE   WA  992111954

COUNTY(S) : WALLA WALLA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 869910 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100270 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100205

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

03/27/2003
07:59

DOT_RGGB01

BR-0012(121)

BASE + A1 TOTAL $1,103,582.25 $980,253.80 -11.18% $1,096,228.80 -0.67% $1,167,092.71 5.75%

BASE + A2 TOTAL $1,103,582.25 $1,044,253.80 -5.38% $921,228.80 -16.52% $969,392.71 -12.16%
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* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO : 02Y022 REVISION NO : 1 BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
CONTRACT NO : 006568 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Apr 28 2003
VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : XL1298
HWY : SR 012 ------- 4TH BIDDER ------- ------- 5TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : US 12 
DIXIE VIC. - BR. REPLACEMENT

02Y022

N.A. DEGERSTROM, INC. PACIFIC ROAD & BRIDGE CO.
3303 N SULLIVAN RD 5802 CEMETERY RD
99216-1676 98223-7781

PROJECT : SPOKANE   WA  992100425 ARLINGTON   WA  982233393

COUNTY(S) : WALLA WALLA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 214002 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100263

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

03/27/2003
07:59

DOT_RGGB01

BR-0012(121)

PREPARATION
1 MOBILIZATION

L.S. 53.23 % 90.32 %
62,000.00 95,000.00 33,000.00 118,000.00 56,000.00

2,300.0000
2 CLEARING AND GRUBBING

2.5000 ACRE 2,000.0000 15.00 % 2,425.0000 21.25 %
5,000.00 5,750.00 750.00 6,062.50 1,062.50

3 REMOVING EXISTING BRIDGE NO. 12/657
L.S. -29.03 % -32.26 %

31,000.00 22,000.00 -9,000.00 21,000.00 -10,000.00

GRADING

3.5000
4  ROADWAY REMOVAL

7780.0000 S.Y. 6.0000 -41.67 % 2.3500 -60.83 %
46,680.00 27,230.00 -19,450.00 18,283.00 -28,397.00

9.0000
5 ROADWAY EXCAVATION INCL. HAUL

470.0000 C.Y. 8.0000 12.50 % 12.0000 50.00 %
3,760.00 4,230.00 470.00 5,640.00 1,880.00

14.0000
6 COMMON BORROW INCL. HAUL

6760.0000 C.Y. 12.0000 16.67 % 5.0000 -58.33 %
81,120.00 94,640.00 13,520.00 33,800.00 -47,320.00

0.5000
7 EMBANKMENT COMPACTION

10580.0000 C.Y. 0.5000 0.00 % 1.9000 280.00 %
5,290.00 5,290.00 0.00 20,102.00 14,812.00

8  DETOUR REMOVAL
L.S. 80.65 % 19.35 %

15,500.00 28,000.00 12,500.00 18,500.00 3,000.00

DRAINAGE

22.0000
9 LIGHT LOOSE RIPRAP

590.0000 TON 50.0000 -56.00 % 32.5000 -35.00 %
29,500.00 12,980.00 -16,520.00 19,175.00 -10,325.00

28.0000
10 PLAIN ST. CULV. PIPE 0.079 IN. TH. 18 IN. DIAM.

120.0000 L.F. 35.0000 -20.00 % 26.0000 -25.71 %
4,200.00 3,360.00 -840.00 3,120.00 -1,080.00
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* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO : 02Y022 REVISION NO : 1 BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
CONTRACT NO : 006568 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Apr 28 2003
VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : XL1298
HWY : SR 012 ------- 4TH BIDDER ------- ------- 5TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : US 12 
DIXIE VIC. - BR. REPLACEMENT

02Y022

N.A. DEGERSTROM, INC. PACIFIC ROAD & BRIDGE CO.
3303 N SULLIVAN RD 5802 CEMETERY RD
99216-1676 98223-7781

PROJECT : SPOKANE   WA  992100425 ARLINGTON   WA  982233393

COUNTY(S) : WALLA WALLA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 214002 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100263

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

03/27/2003
07:59

DOT_RGGB01

BR-0012(121)

DRAINAGE

91.0000
11 PLAIN ST. CULV. PIPE 0.079 IN. TH. 48 IN. DIAM.

80.0000 L.F. 65.0000 40.00 % 189.0000 190.77 %
5,200.00 7,280.00 2,080.00 15,120.00 9,920.00

175.0000
12  HABITAT ROCK

6.0000 EACH 50.0000 250.00 % 200.0000 300.00 %
300.00 1,050.00 750.00 1,200.00 900.00

40.0000
13  STREAMBED GRAVEL

120.0000 C.Y. 30.0000 33.33 % 18.0000 -40.00 %
3,600.00 4,800.00 1,200.00 2,160.00 -1,440.00

STRUCTURE

10.0000
14 STRUCTURE EXCAVATION CLASS A INCL. HAUL

675.0000 C.Y. 15.0000 -33.33 % 23.0000 53.33 %
10,125.00 6,750.00 -3,375.00 15,525.00 5,400.00

15 SHORING OR EXTRA EXCAVATION CL. A - BR. NO. 12/657
L.S. -92.19 % -81.25 %

32,000.00 2,500.00 -29,500.00 6,000.00 -26,000.00

39.0000
16 GRAVEL BACKFILL FOR WALL

190.0000 C.Y. 25.0000 56.00 % 16.5000 -34.00 %
4,750.00 7,410.00 2,660.00 3,135.00 -1,615.00

0.7500
17 ST. REINF. BAR FOR BRIDGE

37680.0000 LB. 0.5000 50.00 % 0.6000 20.00 %
18,840.00 28,260.00 9,420.00 22,608.00 3,768.00

375.0000
18 CONC. CLASS 4000 FOR BRIDGE

213.0000 C.Y. 400.0000 -6.25 % 455.0000 13.75 %
85,200.00 79,875.00 -5,325.00 96,915.00 11,715.00

19 DEFICIENT STRENGTH CONC. PRICE ADJUSTMENT
CALC 0.00 % 0.00 %

1.00 1.00 1.00
20 SUPERSTRUCTURE - BR. NO. 12/657

L.S. 27.82 % 72.18 %
133,000.00 170,000.00 37,000.00 229,000.00 96,000.00

14.0000
21 ELECTRICAL CONDUIT

580.0000 L.F. 10.0000 40.00 % 11.7000 17.00 %
5,800.00 8,120.00 2,320.00 6,786.00 986.00
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* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO : 02Y022 REVISION NO : 1 BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
CONTRACT NO : 006568 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Apr 28 2003
VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : XL1298
HWY : SR 012 ------- 4TH BIDDER ------- ------- 5TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : US 12 
DIXIE VIC. - BR. REPLACEMENT

02Y022

N.A. DEGERSTROM, INC. PACIFIC ROAD & BRIDGE CO.
3303 N SULLIVAN RD 5802 CEMETERY RD
99216-1676 98223-7781

PROJECT : SPOKANE   WA  992100425 ARLINGTON   WA  982233393

COUNTY(S) : WALLA WALLA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 214002 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100263

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

03/27/2003
07:59

DOT_RGGB01

BR-0012(121)

STRUCTURE

60.0000
22 BRIDGE RAILING TYPE BP

268.0000 L.F. 50.0000 20.00 % 53.0000 6.00 %
13,400.00 16,080.00 2,680.00 14,204.00 804.00

125.0000
23 TRAFFIC BARRIER

268.0000 L.F. 70.0000 78.57 % 80.0000 14.29 %
18,760.00 33,500.00 14,740.00 21,440.00 2,680.00

SURFACING

11.0000
24 CRUSHED SURFACING BASE COURSE

7300.0000 TON 10.0000 10.00 % 12.2500 22.50 %
73,000.00 80,300.00 7,300.00 89,425.00 16,425.00

LIQUID ASPHALT
25 ANTI-STRIPPING ADDITIVE

EST. 0.00 % 0.00 %
2,390.00 2,390.00 2,390.00

CEMENT CONCRETE PAVEMENT

200.0000
26 BRIDGE APPROACH SLAB

232.0000 S.Y. 160.0000 25.00 % 178.0000 11.25 %
37,120.00 46,400.00 9,280.00 41,296.00 4,176.00

ASPHALT CONCRETE PAVEMENT

45.0000
27 ASPHALT CONC. PAVEMENT CL. A  PG 64-28

2390.0000 TON 35.0000 28.57 % 44.5000 27.14 %
83,650.00 107,550.00 23,900.00 106,355.00 22,705.00

28 COMPACTION PRICE ADJUSTMENT
CALC 0.00 % 0.00 %

1,434.00 1,434.00 1,434.00
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* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO : 02Y022 REVISION NO : 1 BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
CONTRACT NO : 006568 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Apr 28 2003
VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : XL1298
HWY : SR 012 ------- 4TH BIDDER ------- ------- 5TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : US 12 
DIXIE VIC. - BR. REPLACEMENT

02Y022

N.A. DEGERSTROM, INC. PACIFIC ROAD & BRIDGE CO.
3303 N SULLIVAN RD 5802 CEMETERY RD
99216-1676 98223-7781

PROJECT : SPOKANE   WA  992100425 ARLINGTON   WA  982233393

COUNTY(S) : WALLA WALLA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 214002 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100263

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

03/27/2003
07:59

DOT_RGGB01

BR-0012(121)

EROSION CONTROL AND PLANTING

50.0000
29 ESC LEAD

30.0000 DAY 50.0000 0.00 % 10.0000 -80.00 %
1,500.00 1,500.00 0.00 300.00 -1,200.00

1,100.0000
30 SEEDING AND MULCHING

2.5000 ACRE 1,000.0000 10.00 % 1,000.0000 0.00 %
2,500.00 2,750.00 250.00 2,500.00 0.00

50.0000
31 CHECK DAM

60.0000 L.F. 40.0000 25.00 % 3.0000 -92.50 %
2,400.00 3,000.00 600.00 180.00 -2,220.00

4.0000
32 SILT FENCE

420.0000 L.F. 3.0000 33.33 % 4.0000 33.33 %
1,260.00 1,680.00 420.00 1,680.00 420.00

10.0000
33 TOPSOIL TYPE B

100.0000 C.Y. 12.0000 -16.67 % 10.0000 -16.67 %
1,200.00 1,000.00 -200.00 1,000.00 -200.00

34 EROSION/WATER POLLUTION CONTROL
EST. 0.00 % 0.00 %

2,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00

TRAFFIC

18.0000
35 BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 1

200.0000 L.F. 12.0000 50.00 % 18.0000 50.00 %
2,400.00 3,600.00 1,200.00 3,600.00 1,200.00

925.0000
36 BEAM GUARDRAIL TRANSITION SECTION TYPE 1

4.0000 EACH 1,000.0000 -7.50 % 1,400.0000 40.00 %
4,000.00 3,700.00 -300.00 5,600.00 1,600.00

1,700.0000
37 BEAM GUARDRAIL FLARED TERMINAL

4.0000 EACH 1,500.0000 13.33 % 1,700.0000 13.33 %
6,000.00 6,800.00 800.00 6,800.00 800.00

10.0000
38 TEMPORARY CONC. BARRIER

762.5000 L.F. 10.0000 0.00 % 12.0000 20.00 %
7,625.00 7,625.00 0.00 9,150.00 1,525.00

5,250.0000
39 TEMPORARY IMPACT ATTENUATOR

7.0000 EACH 2,000.0000 162.50 % 4,000.0000 100.00 %
14,000.00 36,750.00 22,750.00 28,000.00 14,000.00
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* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO : 02Y022 REVISION NO : 1 BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
CONTRACT NO : 006568 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Apr 28 2003
VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : XL1298
HWY : SR 012 ------- 4TH BIDDER ------- ------- 5TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : US 12 
DIXIE VIC. - BR. REPLACEMENT

02Y022

N.A. DEGERSTROM, INC. PACIFIC ROAD & BRIDGE CO.
3303 N SULLIVAN RD 5802 CEMETERY RD
99216-1676 98223-7781

PROJECT : SPOKANE   WA  992100425 ARLINGTON   WA  982233393

COUNTY(S) : WALLA WALLA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 214002 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100263

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

03/27/2003
07:59

DOT_RGGB01

BR-0012(121)

TRAFFIC
40 REPAIR IMPACT ATTENUATOR

EST. 0.00 % 0.00 %
1.00 1.00 1.00

0.2000
41 TEMPORARY PAVEMENT MARKING

9169.0000 L.F. 0.2500 -20.00 % 0.4000 60.00 %
2,292.25 1,833.80 -458.45 3,667.60 1,375.35

42 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES
L.S. -37.50 % 0.00 %

2,000.00 1,250.00 -750.00 2,000.00 0.00

33.5000
43 TRAFFIC CONTROL LABOR

560.0000 HR 32.0000 4.69 % 5.0000 -84.38 %
17,920.00 18,760.00 840.00 2,800.00 -15,120.00

35.0000
44 TRAFFIC CONTROL VEHICLE

58.0000 DAY 50.0000 -30.00 % 1.0000 -98.00 %
2,900.00 2,030.00 -870.00 58.00 -2,842.00

35.0000
45 TRAFFIC CONTROL SUPERVISOR

232.0000 HR 35.0000 0.00 % 1.0000 -97.14 %
8,120.00 8,120.00 0.00 232.00 -7,888.00

7.0000
46 CONSTRUCTION SIGNS CLASS A

320.0000 S.F. 6.0000 16.67 % 12.0000 100.00 %
1,920.00 2,240.00 320.00 3,840.00 1,920.00

OTHER ITEMS
47 STRUCTURE SURVEYING

L.S. 28.57 % -14.29 %
7,000.00 9,000.00 2,000.00 6,000.00 -1,000.00

2.0000
48 TRAINING

400.0000 HR 2.0000 0.00 % 1.0000 -50.00 %
800.00 800.00 0.00 400.00 -400.00

49 ROADSIDE CLEANUP
EST. 0.00 % 0.00 %

2,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00
50 REIMBURSEMENT FOR THIRD PARTY DAMAGE

EST. 0.00 % 0.00 %
5.00 5.00 5.00
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* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO : 02Y022 REVISION NO : 1 BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
CONTRACT NO : 006568 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Apr 28 2003
VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : XL1298
HWY : SR 012 ------- 4TH BIDDER ------- ------- 5TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : US 12 
DIXIE VIC. - BR. REPLACEMENT

02Y022

N.A. DEGERSTROM, INC. PACIFIC ROAD & BRIDGE CO.
3303 N SULLIVAN RD 5802 CEMETERY RD
99216-1676 98223-7781

PROJECT : SPOKANE   WA  992100425 ARLINGTON   WA  982233393

COUNTY(S) : WALLA WALLA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 214002 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100263

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

03/27/2003
07:59

DOT_RGGB01

BR-0012(121)

OTHER ITEMS
51 MINOR CHANGE

CALC 0.00 % 0.00 %
-1.00 -1.00 -1.00

52 SPCC PLAN
L.S. 20.00 % -90.00 %

1,000.00 1,200.00 200.00 100.00 -900.00
53 FIELD OFFICE BUILDING

L.S. -6.67 % -20.00 %
7,500.00 7,000.00 -500.00 6,000.00 -1,500.00

3.5000
54 CONSTRUCTION GEOTEXTILE FOR PERMANENT EROSION CONTROL

310.0000 S.Y. 2.0000 75.00 % 2.0000 0.00 %
620.00 1,085.00 465.00 620.00 0.00

BASE TOTAL $911,582.25 $1,027,908.80 12.76 % $1,027,209.10 12.68 %
ALTERNATE A1

55  TEMPORARY BRIDGE NO. 12/657
L.S. -24.48 % -100.00 %

192,000.00 145,000.00 -47,000.00 0.00 -192,000.00

ALTERNATE A1 TOTAL $192,000.00 $145,000.00 -24.48 % NO BID THIS ALTERNATE
ALTERNATE A2

56  TEMPORARY BRIDGE NO. 12/657
L.S. -100.00 % -15.89 %

192,000.00 0.00 -192,000.00 161,500.00 -30,500.00

ALTERNATE A2 TOTAL $192,000.00 NO BID THIS ALTERNATE $161,500.00 -15.89 %

BASE TOTAL $911,582.25 $1,027,908.80 12.76% $1,027,209.10 12.68%
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* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO : 02Y022 REVISION NO : 1 BIDS OPENED ON : Apr 23 2003
CONTRACT NO : 006568 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Apr 28 2003
VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : XL1298
HWY : SR 012 ------- 4TH BIDDER ------- ------- 5TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : US 12 
DIXIE VIC. - BR. REPLACEMENT

02Y022

N.A. DEGERSTROM, INC. PACIFIC ROAD & BRIDGE CO.
3303 N SULLIVAN RD 5802 CEMETERY RD
99216-1676 98223-7781

PROJECT : SPOKANE   WA  992100425 ARLINGTON   WA  982233393

COUNTY(S) : WALLA WALLA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 214002 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100263

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

03/27/2003
07:59

DOT_RGGB01

BR-0012(121)

BASE + A1 TOTAL $1,103,582.25 $1,172,908.80 6.28% $1,027,209.10 -6.92%

BASE + A2 TOTAL $1,103,582.25 $1,027,908.80 -6.86% $1,188,709.10 7.71%





PAGE : 15-A

DOT_RGGB01 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

PS&E JOB NO: 02Y022 * * *   ALTERNATE COMBINATION BIDS   * * * BIDS OPENED ON:
CONTRACT NO: 006568 * * *   RANKED BY DOLLAR AMOUNT   * * * Apr 23 2003

TITLE: US 12
DIXIE VIC. - BR. REPLACEMENT

02Y022

REGION: 5

HWY: SR 012

2208 MAY LN
PO BOX 428
LAGRANDE, OR  978500428

1 $1,044,253.80 BASE + A2 WEAVER CONSTRUCTION CO.

3931 E BOONE AVE
SPOKANE, WA  992024536

2 $1,096,228.80 BASE + A1 HARCON INCORPORATED

331 N FANCHER RD-99211-0831
PO BOX 11954
SPOKANE, WA  992111954

3 $1,167,092.71 BASE + A1 SHEA GRAHAM CONSTRUCTION

3303 N SULLIVAN RD
99216-1676
PO BOX 425
SPOKANE, WA  992100425

4 $1,172,908.80 BASE + A1 N.A. DEGERSTROM, INC.

5802 CEMETERY RD
98223-7781
PO BOX 3393
ARLINGTON, WA  982233393

5 $1,188,709.10 BASE + A2 PACIFIC ROAD & BRIDGE CO.




