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DATE: 05/10/2006
TIME: 14:57

BIDS OPENED ON : May 24 2006

AWARDED ON : May 31 2006

VERSION NO :6 WORK ORDER# : XL2134
HY e LOW BIDDER  ——-mmoe  —mmmeee 2ND BIDDER  —mmmmom  —mmmmee 3RD BIDDER  —-—-m-
TITLE tUS 12 APOLLO, INC. PARSONS RCI INC. SCARSELLA BROS. INC.
ATTALIA VIC. - ADD LANES 1207 W COLUMBIA DR 1216 140TH AVE COURT EAST 8404 S 196TH ST
05Y016 09336-3459 98390-9656 KENT WA 98031-1145
PROJECT - NH-0012(155) KENNEWICK WA 993360617 SUMNER WA 983900370 SEATTLE WA 981680697
COUNTY(S) - WALLA WALLA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100265 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 698405 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 74600C
ENGR*S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./  PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.
PREPARATION
1 MOBILIZATION
L.S. 74.02% 99.28% 99.28%
552,000.00 960,564.00 408,564.00 1,100,000.00 548,000.00 1,100,000.00 548,000.00
2 DELETED ITEM
0.0100 EACH 0.0001 0.0000 0.00% 0.0000 0.00% 0.0000 0.00%
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3 CLEARING AND GRUBBING
L.S. 253.22% 195.86 % 343.79%
33,800.00 119,390.00  85,590.00 100,000.00  66,200.00 150,000.00 116,200.00
4 ARCHAEOLOGICAL AND HISTORICAL SALVAGE
EST. 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
2,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00
5 REMOVAL OF STRUCTURE AND OBSTRUCTION
L.S. 1,397.29% 703.21% 151.00%
9,960.00 149,130.00 139,170.00 80,000.00  70,040.00 25,000.00  15,040.00
6 REMOVING GUARDRAIL
1999.0000 L.F. 1.7500 2.2100 26.29% 5.0000 185.71% 2.0000 14.29%
3,498.25 4,417.79 919.54 9,995.00 6,496.75 3,998.00 499.75
7 REMOVING GUARDRAIL ANCHOR
6.0000 EACH 150.0000 165.8300 10.55% 180.0000 20.00% 150.0000 0.00%
900.00 994.98 94.98 1,080.00 180.00 900.00 0.00
8 REMOVING PAINT LINE
19500.0000 L.F. 0.3000 0.3900 30.00% 0.4000 33.33% 0.4000 33.33%
5,850.00 7,605.00 1,755.00 7,800.00 1,950.00 7,800.00 1,950.00
9 REMOVING TEMPORARY PAVEMENT MARKING
33790.0000 L.F. 0.0500 0.3900 680.00 % 0.1500 200.00 % 0.1500 200.00 %
1,689.50 13,178.10  11,488.60 5,068.50 3,379.00 5,068.50 3,379.00
10  CENTERLINE RUMBLE STRIP REMOVAL
L.S. 116.65% 30.06 % -56.65%
34,600.00 74,962.00  40,362.00 45,000.00  10,400.00 15,000.00 -19,600.00
GRADING
11 ROADWAY EXCAVATION INCL. HAUL
91420.0000 c.v. 3.5000 2.4300 -30.57% 2.6000 -25.71% 4.4000 25.71%
319,970.00 222,150.60 -97,819.40 237,692.00 -82,278.00 402,248.00  82,278.00
12 COMMON BORROW INCL. HAUL
218470.0000 C.Y. 4.0000 2.9900 _25.25% 3.5000 -12.50% 5.0000 25.00%
873,880.00 653,225.30 -220,654.70 764,645.00 -109,235.00 1,092,350.00 218,470.00
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DATE: 05/10/2006

* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * * TIME: 14:57
PS&E JOB NO : 05Y016 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : May 24 2006
CONTRACT NO : 007082 REGION NO :5 AWARDED ON : May 31 2006
VERSION NO :6 WORK ORDER# : XL2134
HWY -sR 012 e LOW BIDDER —————-= —————— 2ND BIDDER  ———-——= - 3RD BIDDER —--——--
TITLE tUsS 12 APOLLO, INC. PARSONS RCI INC. SCARSELLA BROS. INC.
ATTALIA VIC. - ADD LANES 1207 W COLUMBIA DR 1216 140TH AVE COURT EAST 8404 S 196TH ST
05Y016 99336-3459 98390-9656 KENT WA 98031-1145
PROJECT - NH-0012(155) KENNEWICK WA 993360617 WA 983900370 SEATTLE WA 981680697
COUNTY(S)  :WALLA WALLA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100265 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 698405 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 74600C
ENGR*S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF.
GRADING
13 EMBANKMENT COMPACTION
268475 .0000 C.Y. 0.7000 0.6900 -1.43% 0.4000 -42.86% 0.7500 7.14%
187,932.50 185,247.75 -2,684.75 107,390.00 -80,542.50 201,356.25 13,423.75
DRAINAGE
14 GRATE INLET TYPE 2
7.0000 EACH 1,700.0000 1,828.5700 7.56% 2,000.0000 17.65% 2,000.0000 17.65%
11,900.00 12,799.99 899.99 14,000.00 2,100.00 14,000.00 2,100.00
15 LIGHT LOOSE RIPRAP
3.6000 C.Y. 207.0000 221.6700 7.09% 110.0000 -46.86% 100.0000 -51.69%
745.20 798.01 52.81 396.00 -349.20 360.00 -385.20
16 UNDERDRAIN PIPE 8 IN. DIAM.
367.0000 L.F. 15.0000 27.4600 83.07% 12.0000 -20.00% 20.7500 38.33%
5,505.00 10,077.82 4,572.82 4,404.00 -1,101.00 7,615.25 2,110.25
17 UNDERDRAIN PIPE 12 IN. DIAM.
410.0000 L.F. 20.8800 31.3400 50.10% 13.0000 -37.74% 28.7500 37.69%
8,560.80 12,849.40 4,288.60 5,330.00 -3,230.80 11,787.50 3,226.70
18 DRAIN PIPE 8 IN. DIAM.
57.0000 L.F. 15.0000 29.9500 99.67% 20.0000 33.33% 20.7500 38.33%
855.00 1,707.15 852.15 1,140.00 285.00 1,182.75 327.75
19 SCHEDULE A CULV. PIPE 18 IN. DIAM.
571.0000 L.F. 25.0000 39.1100 56.44% 40.0000 60.00% 36.5000 46.00 %
14,275.00 22,331.81 8,056.81 22,840.00 8,565.00 20,841.50 6,566.50
20 DELETED ITEM
0.0100 EACH 0.0001 0.0000 0.00% 0.0000 0.00% 0.0000 0.00%
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
21 CL. IV REINF. CONC. CULV. PIPE 18 IN. DIAM.
197.0000 L.F. 37.0000 68.6100 85.43% 45.0000 21.62% 75.0000 102.70%
7.,289.00 13,516.17 6,227.17 8,865.00 1,576.00 14,775.00 7,486.00
22 CL. V REINF. CONC. CULV. PIPE 12 IN. DIAM.
130.0000 L.F. 40.0000 54.1500 35.38% 55.0000 37.50% 50.0000 25.00%
5,200.00 7,039.50 1,839.50 7,150.00 1,950.00 6,500.00 1,300.00
23 PLAIN ST. PIPE 0.079 IN. TH. 84 IN. DIAM.
167.0000 L.F. 200.0000 387.4500 93.73% 275.0000 37.50% 165.0000 -17.50%
33,400.00 64,704.15 31,304.15 45,925.00 12,525.00 27,555.00 -5,845.00
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DOT_RGGBO1 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE: 05/10/2006
* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * * TIME: 14:57
PS&E JOB NO : 05Y016 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : May 24 2006
CONTRACT NO : 007082 REGION NO :5 AWARDED ON : May 31 2006
VERSION NO :6 WORK ORDER# : XL2134
HWY -sR 012 e LOW BIDDER —————-= —————— 2ND BIDDER  ———-——= - 3RD BIDDER —--——--
TITLE tUsS 12 APOLLO, INC. PARSONS RCI INC. SCARSELLA BROS. INC.
ATTALIA VIC. - ADD LANES 1207 W COLUMBIA DR 1216 140TH AVE COURT EAST 8404 S 196TH ST
05Y016 99336-3459 98390-9656 KENT WA 98031-1145
PROJECT - NH-0012(155) KENNEWICK WA 993360617 WA 983900370 SEATTLE WA 981680697
COUNTY(S)  :WALLA WALLA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100265 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 698405 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 74600C
ENGR*S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF.
STRUCTURE
24 STRUCTURE EXCAVATION CLASS A INCL. HAUL
2580.0000 C.Y. 20.0000 15.3900 -23.05% 5.0000 -75.00% 18.0000 -10.00%
51,600.00 39,706.20 -11,893.80 12,900.00 -38,700.00 46,440.00 -5,160.00
25  SOIL EXCAVATION FOR SHAFT INCLUDING HAUL
280.0000 C.Y. 350.0000 800.4600 128.70% 1,000.0000 185.71% 600.0000 71.43%
98,000.00 224,128.80 126,128.80 280,000.00 182,000.00 168,000.00 70,000.00
26 SHORING OR EXTRA EXCAVATION CL. A - BRIDGE 12/606S
L.S. 239.66% 200.00 % 550.00 %
50,000.00 169,830.00 119,830.00 150,000.00 100,000.00 325,000.00 275,000.00
27 GRAVEL BACKFILL FOR WALL
1104.0000 C.Y. 25.0000 28.4400 13.76% 35.0000 40.00 % 45.5500 82.20%
27,600.00 31,397.76 3,797.76 38,640.00 11,040.00 50,287.20 22,687.20
28  FURNISHING & PLACING TEMP. CASING FOR 8"-0" DIAM. SHAFT
68.0000 L.F. 450.0000 828.7500 84.17% 870.0000 93.33% 790.0000 75.56 %
30,600.00 56,355.00 25,755.00 59,160.00 28,560.00 53,720.00 23,120.00
29  FURNISHING PERMANENT CASING FOR 8"-0"" DIAM. SHAFT
28.0000 L.F. 500.0000 1,381.2500 176.25% 1,450.0000 190.00 % 1,350.0000 170.00%
14,000.00 38,675.00 24,675.00 40,600.00 26,600.00 37,800.00 23,800.00
30 PLACING PERMANENT CASING FOR 87-0" DIAM. SHAFT
4.0000 EACH 10,000.0000 2,762.5000 -72.38% 2,900.0000 -71.00% 3,000.0000 -70.00%
40,000.00 11,050.00 -28,950.00 11,600.00 -28,400.00 12,000.00 -28,000.00
31  CASING SHORING
16.0000 L.F. 400.0000 41.4400 -89.64% 600.0000 50.00% 790.0000 97.50%
6,400.00 663.04 -5,736.96 9,600.00 3,200.00 12,640.00 6,240.00
32  REMOVING SHAFT OBSTRUCTIONS
EST. 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
34,000.00 34,000.00 34,000.00 34,000.00
33 ST. REINF. BAR FOR BRIDGE
137800.0000 LB. 1.0000 0.8500 -15.00% 1.0000 0.00% 0.8500 -15.00%
137,800.00 117,130.00 -20,670.00 137,800.00 0.00 117,130.00 -20,670.00
34 ST. REINF. BAR FOR SHAFT
20200.0000 LB. 1.0000 2.1500 115.00% 1.0000 0.00% 1.7500 75.00 %
20,200.00 43,430.00 23,230.00 20,200.00 0.00 35,350.00 15,150.00
35 CSL ACCESS TUBE
1200.0000 L.F. 8.0000 10.0700 25.87% 5.0000 -37.50% 10.0000 25.00%
9,600.00 12,084.00 2,484.00 6,000.00 -3,600.00 12,000.00 2,400.00
36 CONC. CLASS 4000 FOR BRIDGE
920.0000 C.Y. 500.0000 385.0000 -23.00% 650.0000 30.00% 400.0000 -20.00%
460,000.00 354,200.00 -105,800.00 598,000.00 138,000.00 368,000.00 -92,000.00
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DOT_RGGBO1 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE: 05/10/2006
* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * * TIME: 14:57
PS&E JOB NO : 05Y016 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : May 24 2006
CONTRACT NO : 007082 REGION NO :5 AWARDED ON : May 31 2006
VERSION NO :6 WORK ORDER# : XL2134
HWY -sR 012 e LOW BIDDER —————-= —————— 2ND BIDDER  ———-——= - 3RD BIDDER —--——--
TITLE tUsS 12 APOLLO, INC. PARSONS RCI INC. SCARSELLA BROS. INC.
ATTALIA VIC. - ADD LANES 1207 W COLUMBIA DR 1216 140TH AVE COURT EAST 8404 S 196TH ST
05Y016 99336-3459 98390-9656 KENT WA 98031-1145
PROJECT - NH-0012(155) KENNEWICK WA 993360617 SUMNER WA 983900370 SEATTLE WA 981680697
COUNTY(S)  :WALLA WALLA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100265 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 698405 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 74600C
ENGR*S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF.
STRUCTURE
37 CONC. CLASS 4000P FOR SHAFT
280.0000 C.Y. 250.0000 317.4200 26.97% 300.0000 20.00% 280.0000 12.00%
70,000.00 88,877.60 18,877.60 84,000.00 14,000.00 78,400.00 8,400.00
38 DEFICIENT STRENGTH CONC. PRICE ADJUSTMENT
CALC 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
-2.00 -2.00 -2.00 -2.00
39 SUPERSTRUCTURE - BNSF & UPRR O"XING 12/606S
L.S. -92.89% -13.90% -24.24%
1,122,000.00 79,750.00 1,042,250.00 966,000.00 -156,000.00 850,000.00 -272,000.00
40  PRESTRESSED CONC. GIRDER W83G
3250.0000 L.F. 275.0000 304.7400 10.81% 280.0000 1.82% 300.0000 9.09%
893,750.00 990,405.00 96,655.00 910,000.00 16,250.00 975,000.00 81,250.00
41  BRIDGE APPROACH SLAB JOINT MODIFICATION
L.S. -44.97% -64.29% -64.29%
14,000.00 7,704.00 -6,296.00 5,000.00 -9,000.00 5,000.00 -9,000.00
SURFACING
42 CRUSHED SURFACING BASE COURSE
84533.0000 TON 10.0000 9.7700 -2.30% 10.0000 0.00% 10.1500 1.50%
845,330.00 825,887.41 -19,442.59 845,330.00 0.00 858,009.95 12,679.95
43 DELETED ITEM
0.0100 EACH 0.0001 0.0000 0.00% 0.0000 0.00% 0.0000 0.00%
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
44 CRUSHED SURFACING TOP COURSE
4385.0000 TON 10.7500 9.3700 -12.84% 12.5000 16.28% 11.5000 6.98%
47,138.75 41,087.45 -6,051.30 54,812.50 7,673.75 50,427.50 3,288.75
LIQUID ASPHALT
45 ANTI-STRIPPING ADDITIVE
EST. 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
49,280.00 49,280.00 49,280.00 49,280.00
ASPHALT CONCRETE PAVEMENT
46  PLANING BITUMINOUS PAVEMENT
12050.0000 S.Y. 1.2000 3.3900 182.50% 4.0000 233.33% 3.5000 191.67%
14,460.00 40,849.50 26,389.50 48,200.00 33,740.00 42,175.00 27,715.00
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DOT_RGGBO1 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE: 05/10/2006
* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * * TIME: 14:57
PS&E JOB NO : 05Y016 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : May 24 2006
CONTRACT NO : 007082 REGION NO :5 AWARDED ON : May 31 2006
VERSION NO :6 WORK ORDER# : XL2134
HWY -sR 012 e LOW BIDDER —————-= —————— 2ND BIDDER  ———-——= - 3RD BIDDER —--——--
TITLE tUsS 12 APOLLO, INC. PARSONS RCI INC. SCARSELLA BROS. INC.
ATTALIA VIC. - ADD LANES 1207 W COLUMBIA DR 1216 140TH AVE COURT EAST 8404 S 196TH ST
05Y016 99336-3459 98390-9656 KENT WA 98031-1145
PROJECT - NH-0012(155) KENNEWICK WA 993360617 SUMNER WA 983900370 SEATTLE WA 981680697
COUNTY(S)  :WALLA WALLA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100265 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 698405 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 74600C
ENGR*S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF.
ASPHALT CONCRETE PAVEMENT
47 HMA FOR PRELEVELING CL. 1/2 IN. PG 64-28
5955.0000 TON 42.0000 55.2500 31.55% 62.0000 47.62% 63.0000 50.00 %
250,110.00 329,013.75 78,903.75 369,210.00 119,100.00 375,165.00 125,055.00
48 HMA CL. 1/2 IN. PG 64-28
43980.0000 TON 39.0000 63.8900 63.82% 50.0000 28.21% 52.0000 33.33%
1,715,220.00 2,809,882.20 1,094,662.20 2,199,000.00 483,780.00 2,286,960.00 571,740.00
49 DELETED ITEM
0.0100 EACH 0.0001 0.0000 0.00% 0.0000 0.00% 0.0000 0.00%
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
50 HAUL ROUTE REPAIR
EST. 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
20,000.00 20,000.00 20,000.00 20,000.00
51 JOB MIX COMPLIANCE PRICE ADJUSTMENT
CALC 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
55,200.00 55,200.00 55,200.00 55,200.00
52 COMPACTION PRICE ADJUSTMENT
CALC 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
35,430.00 35,430.00 35,430.00 35,430.00
53 HMA FOR APPROACH CL. 1/2 IN. PG 64-28
418.0000 TON 80.0000 71.8300 -10.21% 77.0000 -3.75% 95.0000 18.75%
33,440.00 30,024.94 -3,415.06 32,186.00 -1,254.00 39,710.00 6,270.00
EROSION CONTROL AND PLANTING
54 ESC LEAD
50.0000 DAY 150.0000 110.5000 -26.33% 50.0000 -66.67% 125.0000 -16.67%
7,500.00 5,525.00 -1,975.00 2,500.00 -5,000.00 6,250.00 -1,250.00
55 SEEDING, FERTILIZING, AND MULCHING
34.8000 ACRE 1,500.0000 1,326.0100 -11.60% 1,740.0000 16.00% 1,400.0000 -6.67%
52,200.00 46,145.15 -6,054.85 60,552.00 8,352.00 48,720.00 -3,480.00
56  SEEDING, FERTILIZING, AND MULCHING (BFM)
5.6000 ACRE 2,200.0000 3,193.3900 45.15% 3,600.0000 63.64% 2,850.0000 29.55%
12,320.00 17,882.98 5,562.98 20,160.00 7,840.00 15,960.00 3,640.00
57 TOPSOIL TYPE B
3627.0000 C.Y. 6.5000 6.1700 -5.08% 9.0000 38.46% 10.0000 53.85%
23,575.50 22,378.59 -1,196.91 32,643.00 9,067.50 36,270.00 12,694.50
58 PAM
98.0000 ACRE 125.0000 138.1200 10.50% 125.0000 0.00% 165.0000 32.00%
12,250.00 13,535.76 1,285.76 12,250.00 0.00 16,170.00 3,920.00
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DOT_RGGBO1 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE: 05/10/2006
* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * * TIME: 14:57
PS&E JOB NO : 05Y016 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : May 24 2006
CONTRACT NO : 007082 REGION NO :5 AWARDED ON : May 31 2006
VERSION NO :6 WORK ORDER# : XL2134
HWY -sR 012 e LOW BIDDER ——————= ————e——— 2ND BIDDER  ———-——= - 3RD BIDDER ——-——--
TITLE tUsS 12 APOLLO, INC. PARSONS RCI INC. SCARSELLA BROS. INC.
ATTALIA VIC. - ADD LANES 1207 W COLUMBIA DR 1216 140TH AVE COURT EAST 8404 S 196TH ST
05Y016 99336-3459 98390-9656 KENT WA 98031-1145
PROJECT - NH-0012(155) KENNEWICK WA 993360617 SUMNER WA 983900370 SEATTLE WA 981680697
COUNTY(S)  :WALLA WALLA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100265 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 698405 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 74600C
ENGR*S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF.
EROSION CONTROL AND PLANTING
59 SOIL BINDER OR TACKING AGENT
34.8000 ACRE 150.0000 193.3600 28.91% 90.0000 -40.00% 150.0000 0.00%
5,220.00 6,728.93 1,508.93 3,132.00 -2,088.00 5,220.00 0.00
60 EROSION/WATER POLLUTION CONTROL
EST. 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
20,000.00 20,000.00 20,000.00 20,000.00
61 CHECK DAM
280.0000 L.F. 20.0000 19.9600 -0.20% 5.0000 -75.00% 50.0000 150.00 %
5,600.00 5,588.80 -11.20 1,400.00 -4,200.00 14,000.00 8,400.00
62 INLET PROTECTION
8.0000 EACH 120.0000 105.0000 -12.50% 60.0000 -50.00% 150.0000 25.00%
960.00 840.00 -120.00 480.00 -480.00 1,200.00 240.00
63 SILT FENCE
590.0000 L.F. 3.2500 5.2800 62.46% 5.0000 53.85% 10.0000 207.69 %
1,917.50 3,115.20 1,197.70 2,950.00 1,032.50 5,900.00 3,982.50
64 WEED CONTROL
EST. 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
5,000.00 5,000.00 5,000.00 5,000.00
65 SOIL AMENDMENT
7868.0000 C.Y. 10.0000 14.9200 49.20% 10.0000 0.00% 142500 42.50%
78,680.00 117,390.56 38,710.56 78,680.00 0.00 112,119.00 33,439.00
66  DEWATER
EST. 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
45,000.00 45,000.00 45,000.00 45,000.00
67 DELETED ITEM
0.0100 EACH 0.0001 0.0000 0.00% 0.0000 0.00% 0.0000 0.00%
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
TRAFFIC
68 EXTRUDED CURB
1565 .0000 L.F. 5.0000 5.5300 10.60% 5.0000 0.00% 4.0000 -20.00%
7,825.00 8,654.45 829.45 7,825.00 0.00 6,260.00 -1,565.00
69 BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 1
4085.0000 L.F. 12.0000 17.5700 46.42% 20.0000 66.67% 15.9000 32.50%
49,020.00 71,773.45 22,753.45 81,700.00 32,680.00 64,951.50 15,931.50
70 BEAM GUARDRAIL TRANSITION SECTION TYPE 10
3.0000 EACH 1,200.0000 1,856.3300 54.69% 1,100.0000 -8.33% 1,680.0000 40.00 %
3,600.00 5,568.99 1,968.99 3,300.00 -300.00 5,040.00 1,440.00
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DOT_RGGBO1 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE: 05/10/2006
* * % BID CHECK REPORT * * * TIME: 14:57
PS&E JOB NO : 05Y016 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : May 24 2006
CONTRACT NO : 007082 REGION NO  :5 AWARDED ON : May 31 2006
VERSION NO WORK ORDER# : XL2134
wy o ssmolz T e LOW BIDDER ——-m-m-m ——mmmmm 2ND BIDDER  —m—mmmm  —mmmmem 3RD BIDDER  —-—-——-
TITLE APOLLO, INC. PARSONS RCI INC. SCARSELLA BROS. INC.
ATTALIA VIC. - ADD LANES 1207 W COLUMBIA DR 1216 140TH AVE COURT EAST 8404 S 196TH ST
05Y016 99336-3459 98390-9656 KENT WA 98031-1145
PROJECT - NH-0012(155) KENNEWICK WA 993360617 SUMNER WA 983900370 SEATTLE WA 981680697
COUNTY(S) - WALLA WALLA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100265 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 698405 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 74600C
ENGR*S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./  PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT .DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT .DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT .DIFF.
TRAFFIC
71 BEAM GUARDRAIL TRANSITION SECTION TYPE 11
4.0000 EACH 1,200.0000 1,696.2500 41.35% 1,100.0000 -8.33% 1,535.0000 27.92%
4,800.00 6,785.00 1,985.00 4,400.00 -400.00 6,140.00 1,340.00
72 BEAM GUARDRAIL NON-FLARED TERMINAL
1.0000 EACH 1,700.0000 2,486.0000 46.24% 2,200.0000 29.41% 2,250.0000 32.35%
1,700.00 2,486.00 786.00 2,200.00 500.00 2,250.00 550.00
73 BEAM GUARDRAIL FLARED TERMINAL
3.0000 EACH 1,700.0000 1,956.0000 15.06 % 1,700.0000 0.00% 1,770.0000 4.12%
5,100.00 5,868.00 768.00 5,100.00 0.00 5,310.00 210.00
74 BEAM GUARDRAIL ANCHOR TYPE 1
2.0000 EACH 400.0000 663.0000 65.75% 640.0000 60.00 % 600.0000 50.00 %
800.00 1,326.00 526.00 1,280.00 480.00 1,200.00 400.00
75 BEAM GUARDRAIL ANCHOR TYPE 4
1.0000 EACH 400.0000 608.0000 52.00% 600.0000 50.00 % 550.0000 37.50%
400.00 608.00 208.00 600.00 200.00 550.00 150.00
76 RAISING EXISTING BEAM GUARDRAIL
70.0000 L.F. 3.0000 5.5300 84.33% 6.0000 100.00 % 5.0000 66.67 %
210.00 387.10 177.10 420.00 210.00 350.00 140.00
77 SINGLE SLOPE CONCRETE BARRIER
173.5000 L.F. 75.0000 187.8500 150.47 % 160.0000 113.33% 215.0000 186.67%
13,012.50 32,591.98  19,579.47 27,760.00  14,747.50 37,302.50  24,290.00
78 TEMPORARY CONC. BARRIER
1425.0000 L.F. 9.0000 13.8100 53.44% 20.0000 122.22% 16.5000 83.33%
12,825.00 19,679.25 6,854.25 28,500.00  15,675.00 23,512.50  10,687.50
79 TEMPORARY IMPACT ATTENUATOR
2.0000 EACH 5,000.0000 4,420.0000 ~11.60% 5,200.0000 4.00% 5,000.0000 0.00%
10,000.00 8,840.00 -1,160.00 10,400.00 400.00 10,000.00 0.00
80 PERMANENT IMPACT ATTENUATOR
1.0000 EACH 20,000.0000 24,863.0000 24.32% 22,000.0000 10.00% 25,000.0000 25.00%
20,000.00 24,863.00 4,863.00 22,000.00 2,000.00 25,000.00 5,000.00
81 TRUCK-MOUNTED IMPACT ATTENUATOR
2.0000 EACH 1,400.0000 1,657.5000 18.39% 3,000.0000 114.29% 7,500.0000 435.71%
2,800.00 3,315.00 515.00 6,000.00 3,200.00 15,000.00  12,200.00
82 OPERATION OF TRUCK-MOUNTED IMPACT ATTENUATOR
80.0000 HR 60.0000 77.3500 28.92% 40.0000 -33.33% 85.0000 41.67%
4,800.00 6,188.00 1,388.00 3,200.00  -1,600.00 6,800.00 2,000.00
83 REPAIR TRUCK-MOUNTED IMPACT ATTENUATOR
EST. 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00



DOT_RGGBO1

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

PAGE : 8-A

DATE: 05/10/2006

* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * * TIME: 14:57
PS&E JOB NO : 05Y016 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : May 24 2006
CONTRACT NO : 007082 REGION NO :5 AWARDED ON : May 31 2006
VERSION NO :6 WORK ORDER# : XL2134
HWY -sR 012 e LOW BIDDER —————-= —————— 2ND BIDDER  ———-——= - 3RD BIDDER —--——--
TITLE tUsS 12 APOLLO, INC. PARSONS RCI INC. SCARSELLA BROS. INC.
ATTALIA VIC. - ADD LANES 1207 W COLUMBIA DR 1216 140TH AVE COURT EAST 8404 S 196TH ST
05Y016 99336-3459 98390-9656 KENT WA 98031-1145
PROJECT - NH-0012(155) KENNEWICK WA 993360617 WA 983900370 SEATTLE WA 981680697
COUNTY(S)  :WALLA WALLA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100265 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 698405 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 74600C
ENGR*S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF.
TRAFFIC
84 FLEXIBLE GUIDE POST
268.0000 EACH 18.0000 24.3100 35.06% 22.0000 22.22% 22.5000 25.00%
4,824.00 6,515.08 1,691.08 5,896.00 1,072.00 6,030.00 1,206.00
85 BARRIER DELINEATOR
6.0000 EACH 10.0000 13.3300 33.30% 15.0000 50.00% 30.0000 200.00 %
60.00 79.98 19.98 90.00 30.00 180.00 120.00
86 PAINT LINE
92300.0000 L.F. 0.0800 0.0800 0.00% 0.1000 25.00% 0.0900 12.50%
7,384.00 7,384.00 0.00 9,230.00 1,846.00 8,307.00 923.00
87 PLASTIC DROP LANE LINE
920.0000 L.F. 1.0000 0.5000 -50.00% 1.1000 10.00% 1.1000 10.00%
920.00 460.00 -460.00 1,012.00 92.00 1,012.00 92.00
88 PLASTIC WIDE LINE
10710.0000 L.F. 1.5000 0.9700 -35.33% 1.1000 -26.67% 1.1000 -26.67%
16,065.00 10,388.70 -5,676.30 11,781.00 -4,284.00 11,781.00 -4,284.00
89 PLASTIC STOP LINE
243.0000 L.F. 7.0000 1.6500 -76.43% 4.0000 -42.86% 4.0000 -42.86%
1,701.00 400.95 -1,300.05 972.00 -729.00 972.00 -729.00
90 PLASTIC TRAFFIC ARROW
44.0000 EACH 75.0000 121.5500 62.07% 45.0000 -40.00% 45.0000 -40.00%
3,300.00 5,348.20 2,048.20 1,980.00 -1,320.00 1,980.00 -1,320.00
91 RECESSED PAVEMENT MARKER
10.5000 HUND 850.0000 850.8600 0.10% 770.0000 -9.41% 770.0000 -9.41%
8,925.00 8,934.03 9.03 8,085.00 -840.00 8,085.00 -840.00
92 TEMPORARY PAVEMENT MARKING
620000000 L.F. 0.0700 0.1100 57.14% 0.1000 42.86% 0.1000 42.86%
4,340.00 6,820.00 2,480.00 6,200.00 1,860.00 6,200.00 1,860.00
93 PERMANENT SIGNING
L.S. 39.35% 32.74% -0.93%
11,300.00 15,746.00 4,446.00 15,000.00 3,700.00 11,195.00 -105.00
94 ILLUMINATION SYSTEM
L.S. 1.07% -10.27% -2.79%
133,732.00 135,164.00 1,432.00 120,000.00 -13,732.00 130,000.00 -3,732.00
95 CONDUIT PIPE 2 IN. DIAM.
2840.0000 L.F. 15.0000 17.4600 16.40% 16.0000 6.67% 17.0000 13.33%
42,600.00 49,586.40 6,986.40 45,440.00 2,840.00 48,280.00 5,680.00
96 SEQUENTIAL ARROW SIGN
200.0000 HR 5.0000 4.4200 -11.60% 5.0000 0.00% 5.0000 0.00%
1,000.00 884.00 -116.00 1,000.00 0.00 1,000.00 0.00
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DOT_RGGBO1 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE: 05/10/2006
* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * * TIME: 14:57
PS&E JOB NO : 05Y016 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : May 24 2006
CONTRACT NO : 007082 REGION NO :5 AWARDED ON : May 31 2006
VERSION NO :6 WORK ORDER# : XL2134
HWY -sR 012 e LOW BIDDER —————-= —————— 2ND BIDDER  ———-——= - 3RD BIDDER —--——--
TITLE tUsS 12 APOLLO, INC. PARSONS RCI INC. SCARSELLA BROS. INC.
ATTALIA VIC. - ADD LANES 1207 W COLUMBIA DR 1216 140TH AVE COURT EAST 8404 S 196TH ST
05Y016 99336-3459 98390-9656 KENT WA 98031-1145
PROJECT - NH-0012(155) KENNEWICK WA 993360617 SUMNER WA 983900370 SEATTLE WA 981680697
COUNTY(S)  :WALLA WALLA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100265 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 698405 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 74600C
ENGR*S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF.
TRAFFIC
97 PORTABLE CHANGEABLE MESSAGE SIGN
3.0000 EACH 2,500.0000 7.,182.6700 187.31% 20,000.0000 700.00 % 7,500.0000 200.00 %
7,500.00 21,548.01 14,048.01 60,000.00 52,500.00 22,500.00 15,000.00
98 OPERATION OF PORTABLE CHANGEABLE MESSAGE SIGN
11520.0000 HR 3.5000 2.2100 -36.86% 0.1000 -97.14% 3.5000 0.00%
40,320.00 25,459.20 -14,860.80 1,152.00 -39,168.00 40,320.00 0.00
99 OTHER TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL
L.S. 77.41% 92.66% 129.36%
21,800.00 38,675.00 16,875.00 42,000.00 20,200.00 50,000.00 28,200.00
100 FLAGGERS AND SPOTTERS
5100.0000 HR 34.0000 38.1200 12.12% 33.0000 -2.94% 36.2500 6.62%
173,400.00 194,412.00 21,012.00 168,300.00 -5,100.00 184,875.00 11,475.00
101 OTHER TRAFFIC CONTROL LABOR
3400.0000 HR 34.0000 39.7800 17.00% 34.0000 0.00% 36.2500 6.62%
115,600.00 135,252.00 19,652.00 115,600.00 0.00 123,250.00 7,650.00
102 TRAFFIC CONTROL SUPERVISOR
L.S. 33.28% -67.84% 82.75%
68,400.00 91,163.00 22,763.00 22,000.00 -46,400.00 125,000.00 56,600.00
103 CONSTRUCTION SIGNS CLASS A
950.0000 S.F. 10.0000 11.0500 10.50% 12.0000 20.00% 15.0000 50.00 %
9,500.00 10,497.50 997.50 11,400.00 1,900.00 14,250.00 4,750.00
OTHER ITEMS
104 STRUCTURE EXCAVATION CLASS B INCL. HAUL
927.0000 C.Y. 8.0000 0.1100 -98.63% 10.0000 25.00% 10.0000 25.00%
7,416.00 101.97 -7,314.03 9,270.00 1,854.00 9,270.00 1,854.00
105 DELETED ITEM
0.0100 EACH 0.0001 0.0000 0.00% 0.0000 0.00% 0.0000 0.00%
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
106 SHORING OR EXTRA EXCAVATION CLASS B
2395.0000 S.F. 2.0000 0.0900 -95.50% 1.0000 -50.00 % 1.0000 -50.00%
4,790.00 215.55 -4,574.45 2,395.00 -2,395.00 2,395.00 -2,395.00
107 DELETED ITEM
0.0100 EACH 0.0001 0.0000 0.00% 0.0000 0.00% 0.0000 0.00%
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
108 GRAVEL BACKFILL FOR DRAIN
19.0000 C.Y. 25.0000 15.8400 -36.64% 60.0000 140.00 % 85.0000 240.00 %
475.00 300.96 -174.04 1,140.00 665.00 1,615.00 1,140.00
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DATE: 05/10/2006
TIME: 14:57

BIDS OPENED ON : May 24 2006

AWARDED ON : May 31 2006

HWY -sR 012 e LOW BIDDER ——————= ————e——— 2ND BIDDER  ———-——= - 3RD BIDDER ——-——--
TITLE tUsS 12 APOLLO, INC. PARSONS RCI INC. SCARSELLA BROS. INC.
ATTALIA VIC. - ADD LANES 1207 W COLUMBIA DR 1216 140TH AVE COURT EAST 8404 S 196TH ST
05Y016 99336-3459 98390-9656 KENT WA 98031-1145
PROJECT - NH-0012(155) KENNEWICK WA 993360617 SUMNER WA 983900370 SEATTLE WA 981680697
COUNTY(S)  :WALLA WALLA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100265 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 698405 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 74600C
ENGR*S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF.
OTHER ITEMS
109 WATER
18197.6400 MGAL 10.0000 7.4600 -25.40% 1.0000 -90.00 % 10.0000 0.00%
181,976.40 135,754.39 -46,222.01 18,197.64 -163,778.76 181,976.40 0.00
110 PLUGGING EXISTING PIPE
5.0000 EACH 386.0000 324.8000 -15.85% 250.0000 -35.23% 500.0000 29.53%
1,930.00 1,624.00 -306.00 1,250.00 -680.00 2,500.00 570.00
111 STRUCTURE SURVEYING
L.S. 19.34% 20.00% 40.00 %
25,000.00 29,835.00 4,835.00 30,000.00 5,000.00 35,000.00 10,000.00
112 WIRE FENCE TYPE 2
26417.0000 L.F. 2.0000 3.4400 72.00% 3.0000 50.00% 3.5500 77.50%
52,834.00 90,874.48 38,040.48 79,251.00 26,417.00 93,780.35 40,946.35
113 TRAINING
1500.0000 HR 2.0000 1.0000 -50.00% 1.0000 -50.00% 5.0000 150.00 %
3,000.00 1,500.00 -1,500.00 1,500.00 -1,500.00 7,500.00 4,500.00
114 ROADSIDE CLEANUP
EST. 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
2,500.00 2,500.00 2,500.00 2,500.00
115 TRIMMING AND CLEANUP
L.S. 101.56% 200.00 % 50.00 %
5,000.00 10,078.00 5,078.00 15,000.00 10,000.00 7,500.00 2,500.00
116 REIMBURSEMENT FOR THIRD PARTY DAMAGE
EST. 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00
117 MINOR CHANGE
CALC 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
-1.00 -1.00 -1.00 -1.00
118 AGGREGATE COMPLIANCE PRICE ADJUSTMENT
CALC 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
40,430.00 40,430.00 40,430.00 40,430.00
119 SPCC PLAN
L.S. -83.33% 166.67% 233.33%
1,500.00 250.00 -1,250.00 4,000.00 2,500.00 5,000.00 3,500.00
120 FIELD OFFICE BUILDING
L.S. 88.62% 400.00% 150.00 %
5,000.00 9,431.00 4,431.00 25,000.00 20,000.00 12,500.00 7,500.00
121 CONSTRUCTION GEOTEXTILE FOR SOIL STABILIZATION
18125.0000 S.Y. 1.7000 1.0500 -38.24% 2.0000 17.65% 1.7500 2.94%
30,812.50 19,031.25 -11,781.25 36,250.00 5,437.50 31,718.75 906.25
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DOT_RGGBO1 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE: 05/10/2006
* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * * TIME: 14:57
PS&E JOB NO : 05Y016 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : May 24 2006
CONTRACT NO : 007082 REGION NO :5 AWARDED ON : May 31 2006
VERSION NO :6 WORK ORDER# : XL2134
HWY -sR 012 e LOW BIDDER —————-= —————— 2ND BIDDER  ———-——= - 3RD BIDDER —--——--
TITLE tUsS 12 APOLLO, INC. PARSONS RCI INC. SCARSELLA BROS. INC.
ATTALIA VIC. - ADD LANES 1207 W COLUMBIA DR 1216 140TH AVE COURT EAST 8404 S 196TH ST
05Y016 99336-3459 98390-9656 KENT WA 98031-1145
PROJECT - NH-0012(155) KENNEWICK WA 993360617 SUMNER WA 983900370 SEATTLE WA 981680697
COUNTY(S)  :WALLA WALLA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100265 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 698405 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 74600C
ENGR*S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF.
OTHER ITEMS
122 HIGH VISIBILITY FENCE
2150.0000 L.F. 3.7500 5.0000 33.33% 3.0000 -20.00% 3.5000 -6.67%
8,062.50 10,750.00 2,687.50 6,450.00 -1,612.50 7,525.00 -537.50
123  BORROW SITE BERM
EST. 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
10,000.00 10,000.00 10,000.00 10,000.00
124  MAINTAIN BOISE"S COMPOST OPERATIONS
EST. 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
30,000.00 30,000.00 30,000.00 30,000.00
125 ACCESS CONTROL GATE
1.0000 EACH 2,000.0000 1,008.0000 -49.60% 3,000.0000 50.00% 1,250.0000 -37.50%
2,000.00 1,008.00 -992.00 3,000.00 1,000.00 1,250.00 -750.00
126  REMOVING 66 IN. DIAM STEEL PIPE
131.0000 L.F. 30.0000 57.1400 90.47% 80.0000 166.67 % 100.0000 233.33%
3,930.00 7,485.34 3,555.34 10,480.00 6,550.00 13,100.00 9,170.00
127  TRANSPORT FURNISHED MATERIALS
L.S. -77.78% 56.00% 0.00%
5,000.00 1,111.00 -3,889.00 7,800.00 2,800.00 5,000.00 0.00
128  INSTALL WELDED ST. PIPE 0.375 IN. TH. 66 IN. DIAM.
260.0000 L.F. 250.0000 174.2700 -30.29% 330.0000 32.00% 500.0000 100.00 %
65,000.00 45,310.20 -19,689.80 85,800.00 20,800.00 130,000.00 65,000.00
129 66 IN. DIAM. ST. PIPE BEND
4.0000 EACH 2,000.0000 10,393.7500 419.69 % 3,000.0000 50.00% 9,000.0000 350.00 %
8,000.00 41,575.00 33,575.00 12,000.00 4,000.00 36,000.00 28,000.00
130  AIR VENTS, CASING SPACERS, END SEALS
L.S. -74.35% -66.67% 157.33%
15,000.00 3,848.00 -11,152.00 5,000.00 -10,000.00 38,600.00 23,600.00
131  DIG AND VERIFY EXISTING FACILITY
2.0000 EACH 1,000.0000 333.5000 -66.65% 200.0000 -80.00% 2,000.0000 100.00 %
2,000.00 667.00 -1,333.00 400.00 -1,600.00 4,000.00 2,000.00
132  PIPE BEDDING AND PIPE ZONE BACKFILL
700.0000 C.Y. 15.0000 21.0700 40.47% 24.0000 60.00 % 30.0000 100.00 %
10,500.00 14,749.00 4,249.00 16,800.00 6,300.00 21,000.00 10,500.00
133 CONTROLLED DENSITY FILL
160.0000 C.Y. 150.0000 185.7500 23.83% 175.0000 16.67% 110.0000 -26.67%
24,000.00 29,720.00 5,720.00 28,000.00 4,000.00 17,600.00 -6,400.00
134 MANHOLE 48 IN. DIAM. TYPE 1
1.0000 EACH 2,000.0000 2,300.0000 15.00% 1,200.0000 -40.00% 2,000.0000 0.00%
2,000.00 2,300.00 300.00 1,200.00 -800.00 2,000.00 0.00
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DOT_RGGBO1 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE: 05/10/2006
* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * * TIME: 14:57
PS&E JOB NO : 05Y016 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : May 24 2006
CONTRACT NO : 007082 REGION NO :5 AWARDED ON : May 31 2006
VERSION NO :6 WORK ORDER# : XL2134
HWY -sR 012 e LOW BIDDER —————-= —————— 2ND BIDDER  ———-——= - 3RD BIDDER —--——--
TITLE tUsS 12 APOLLO, INC. PARSONS RCI INC. SCARSELLA BROS. INC.
ATTALIA VIC. - ADD LANES 1207 W COLUMBIA DR 1216 140TH AVE COURT EAST 8404 S 196TH ST
05Y016 99336-3459 98390-9656 KENT WA 98031-1145
PROJECT - NH-0012(155) KENNEWICK WA 993360617 SUMNER WA 983900370 SEATTLE WA 981680697
COUNTY(S)  :WALLA WALLA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100265 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 698405 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 74600C
ENGR*S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF.
OTHER ITEMS
135  MANWAY AND FITTINGS
L.S. 149.20% 275.00% 112.50%
4,000.00 9,968.00 5,968.00 15,000.00 11,000.00 8,500.00 4,500.00
136  REMOVAL OF RAILWAY COMMUNICATION LINES
L.S. -54.66% 200.00 % 50.00 %
5,000.00 2,267.00 -2,733.00 15,000.00 10,000.00 7,500.00 2,500.00
137 CURE BOX
L.S. -99.99% -90.00% -90.00%
10,000.00 1.00 -9,999.00 1,000.00 -9,000.00 1,000.00 -9,000.00
BASE TOTAL $9,905,918.90 $10,900,207.55 10.04%  $11,293,559.64 14.01% $12,206,922.40 23.23%
ALTERNATE Al
138 ST. REINF. BAR FOR RETAINING WALL
30000.0000 LB. 1.0000 1.0700 7.00% 1.0000 0.00% 0.0000 -100.00 %
30,000.00 32,100.00 2,100.00 30,000.00 0.00 0.00 -30,000.00
139 CONC. CLASS 4000 FOR RETAINING WALL
353.0000 C.Y. 500.0000 380.0000 -24.00% 350.0000 -30.00% 0.0000 -100.00 %
176,500.00 134,140.00 -42,360.00 123,550.00 -52,950.00 0.00 -176,500.00
140 TRAFFIC BARRIER
1327.0000 L.F. 100.0000 77.3500 -22.65% 100.0000 0.00% 0.0000 -100.00%
132,700.00 102,643.45 -30,056.55 132,700.00 0.00 0.00 -132,700.00
141 BRIDGE APPROACH SLAB
287.0000 S.Y. 225.0000 183.5600 -18.42% 350.0000 55.56 % 0.0000 -100.00 %
64,575.00 52,681.72 -11,893.28 100,450.00 35,875.00 0.00 -64,575.00
ALTERNATE Al TOTAL $403,775.00 $321,565.17 -20.36% $386,700.00 -4.23% NO BID THIS ALTERNATE
ALTERNATE A2
142 TRAFFIC BARRIER
1233.0000 L.F. 100.0000 0.0000 -100.00% 88.0000 -12.00% 100.0000 0.00%
123,300.00 0.00 -123,300.00 108,504.00 -14,796.00 123,300.00 0.00
143 GEOSYNTHETIC WALL F - SHAPE TRAFFIC BARRIER
76.0000 L.F. 275.0000 0.0000 -100.00% 245.0000 -10.91% 150.0000 -45.45%
20,900.00 0.00 -20,900.00 18,620.00 -2,280.00 11,400.00 -9,500.00
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DOT_RGGBO1 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE: 05/10/2006
* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * * TIME: 14:57
PS&E JOB NO : 05Y016 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : May 24 2006
CONTRACT NO : 007082 REGION NO  :5 AWARDED ON : May 31 2006
VERSION NO :6 WORK ORDER# : XL2134
HiY e LOW BIDDER ————=—= ———m—m 2ND BIDDER  ————--m  ———mm o 3RD BIDDER ---—-—-
TITLE tUs 12 APOLLO, INC. PARSONS RCI INC. SCARSELLA BROS. INC.
ATTALIA VIC. - ADD LANES 1207 W COLUMBIA DR 1216 140TH AVE COURT EAST 8404 S 196TH ST
05Y016 99336-3459 98390-9656 KENT WA 98031-1145
PROJECT - NH-0012(155) KENNEWICK WA 993360617 SUMNER WA 983900370 SEATTLE WA 981680697
COUNTY(S) - WALLA WALLA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100265 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 698405 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 74600C
ENGR"S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./  PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT .DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.
ALTERNATE A2
144 CONCRETE FASCIA PANEL
2460.0000 S.F. 35.0000 0.0000 -100.00% 37.0000 5.71% 34.0000 -2.86%
86,100.00 0.00 -86,100.00 91,020.00 4,920.00 83,640.00  -2,460.00
145 BRIDGE APPROACH SLAB
319.0000 S.Y. 225.0000 0.0000 -100.00% 275.0000 22.22% 250.0000 11.11%
71,775.00 0.00 -71,775.00 87,725.00  15,950.00 79,750.00 7,975.00
146 GEOSYNTHETIC RETAINING WALL
2460.0000 S.F. 15.0000 0.0000 -100.00% 9.0000 -40.00% 12.5000 -16.67%
36,900.00 0.00 -36,900.00 22,140.00 -14,760.00 30,750.00  -6,150.00
ALTERNATE A2 TOTAL $338,975.00 NO BID THIS ALTERNATE $328,009.00 -3.24% $328,840.00 -2.99%
BASE TOTAL $9,905,918.90 $10,900,207.55 10.04%  $11,293,559.64 14.01% $12,206,922.40 23.23%
BASE + ALl CONTRACT TOTAL (A) $10,309,693.90 $11,221,772.72 8.85%  $11,680,259.64 13.29% NO BID THIS ALTERNATE
BASE + A2 CONTRACT TOTAL (A) $10,244,893.90 NO BID THIS ALTERNATE $11,621,568.64 13.44% $12,535,762.40 22.36%
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ALTERNATE COMBINATION BIDS
RANKED BY DOLLAR AMOUNT

HWY: SR 012

el BIDS OPENED ON:
il May 24 2006
REGION: 5

APOLLO, INC.

1207 W COLUMBIA DR
99336-3459

PO BOX 7305

KENNEWICK, WA 993360617

PARSONS RCI INC.

1216 140TH AVE COURT EAST
98390-9656

PO BOX 1730

SUMNER, WA 983900370

PARSONS RCI INC.

1216 140TH AVE COURT EAST
98390-9656

PO BOX 1730

SUMNER, WA 983900370

SCARSELLA BROS. INC.

8404 S 196TH ST

KENT WA 98031-1145

PO BOX 68697

SEATTLE, WA 981680697
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